

"UNCONFIRMED TENDER RESULTS"

CONTRACT #PW-C-12-2020-20-E0

Culvert Replacements

Tender Opening Date and Time: January 30, 2020 @ 1:55 PM

COMPANY	PRICE BID SCHEDULE "A"	PRICE BID SCHEDULE "B"	PRICE BID SCHEDULE "C"
G. Tackaberry & Sons Construction Company Limited	No Bid	No Bid	\$123,350.00
Thomas Cavanagh Construction Limited	\$174,309.62	\$96,859.10	\$102,921.84
Arnott Brothers Construction Ltd.	\$148,700.00	\$76,180.00	\$88,700.00
Crains Construction Limited	\$152,987.50	\$91,820.00	\$120,970.00
National Structures 2011 Inc.	\$173,110.00	\$87,216.00	\$97,988.00
W. H. MacSweyn Inc.	No Bid	\$121,900.00	\$117,900.00
D W Building Restoration Services Inc.	No Bid	\$89,333.38	No Bid

NOTE: The Harmonized Sales Tax (HST) will be paid in addition to the above tendered price on applicable expenses.

The above prices are "as read aloud" at the tender opening. No evaluation of documents or calculation verifications have been undertaken at this time.